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Adams County Development Standards and Regulations 2-41 

2-02-06-02 REGISTRATION PROCEDURE 

2-02-06-02-01 APPLICATION AND CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE TO BE 
SUBMITTED 

Applications for contractor registration shall be submitted on forms provided 
by the Chief Building Official. Each application shall be accompanied by a 
certificate of insurance indicating the applicant has liability insurance 
coverage in an amount of at least one hundred thousand dollars ($100,000) 
covering the type of registration requested. 

2-02-06-02-02 EXAMINATION WAIVED 

The Chief Building Official may license or register, without examination, 
applicants who are duly licensed under the laws of the State of Colorado, the 
City and County of Denver, and other counties, or municipalities within the 
State of Colorado for the licensing and the regulating of the plumbing trade, 
mechanical trade, building trade, etc., deemed by the Chief Building Official 
to be equivalent to the requirements of the County building code. 

2-02-06-02-03 REGISTRATION OF ELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS 

Electrical contractors shall be licensed by the State of Colorado and registered 
with the Chief Building Official before performing any electrical work within 
Adams County. Registrations shall be valid for three (3) years from the date of 
issuance. 

2-02-06-02-04 REGISTRATION OF PLUMBING CONTRACTORS 

Plumbing contractors shall be licensed by the State of Colorado and registered 
with the Chief Building Official before performing any plumbing work within 
Adams County. Registration shall be valid for three (3) years from the date of 
issuance. 

2-02-06-02-05 REGISTRATION OF ALL OTHER CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTORS 

All contractors performing work involving the construction, alteration, 
remodeling, repairing, or equipping of buildings or other structures in Adams 
County shall be licensed by the City and County of Denver, other counties, or 
municipalities within the State of Colorado or International Code Council. 
Registration shall be valid for one (1) year from the date of issuance. 


